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In the aftermath of the Crisis, experience the first major crossover after CRISIS ON INFINITE EARTHS
with veteran writers John Ostrander (SUICIDE SQUAD) and Len Wein (SWAMP THING), along with
superstar artists John Byrne (SUPERMAN) and Karl Kesel (HARLEY QUINN)!

Out of the ashes of the greatest interdimensional holocaust comes a new generation of superheroes: Wonder
Woman, the Suicide Squad, the Flash, and the all-new Justice League! But first they must take on a fight to
the finish with the deadly minions of Darkseid the Destroyer in order to earn the right to join Superman,
Batman, Captain Marvel, and Green Lantern as the mightiest heroes of modern times. This is the story
of…Legends!

Collects LEGENDS #1-6.
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From reader reviews:

Bridget Carter:

This Legends 30th Anniversary Edition book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your
hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is usually information inside this book incredible fresh, you
will get details which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. That Legends
30th Anniversary Edition without we comprehend teach the one who reading through it become critical in
considering and analyzing. Don't become worry Legends 30th Anniversary Edition can bring once you are
and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it with your lovely
laptop even cell phone. This Legends 30th Anniversary Edition having great arrangement in word and also
layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Glenn Hancock:

The particular book Legends 30th Anniversary Edition will bring one to the new experience of reading a
book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to study, this
book very suited to you. The book Legends 30th Anniversary Edition is much recommended to you to read.
You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Janet Warren:

The reserve untitled Legends 30th Anniversary Edition is the publication that recommended to you to study.
You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to you. The language that article author use
to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of research when
write the book, therefore the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also will get the
e-book of Legends 30th Anniversary Edition from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Tracy Brown:

The guide with title Legends 30th Anniversary Edition has lot of information that you can study it. You can
get a lot of help after read this book. This particular book exist new expertise the information that exist in
this book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how
the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you throughout new era of the globalization.
You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.
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