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Frankenstein; or, The Modern Prometheus, generally known as Frankenstein, is a novel written by the British
author Mary Shelley. The title of the novel refers to a scientist, Victor Frankenstein, who learns how to
create life and creates a being in the likeness of man, but larger than average and more powerful. In popular
culture, people have tended to refer to the Creature as "Frankenstein", despite this being the name of the
scientist. Frankenstein is a novel infused with some elements of the Gothic novel and the Romantic
movement. It was also a warning against the "over-reaching" of modern man and the Industrial Revolution,
alluded to in the novel's subtitle, The Modern Prometheus. The story has had an influence across literature
and popular culture and spawned a complete genre of horror stories and films. It is arguably considered the
first fully realized science fiction novel.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Grant:

The actual book Frankenstein (Illustrated) will bring someone to the new experience of reading a book. The
author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to read, this book very ideal
to you. The book Frankenstein (Illustrated) is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book
in the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Alexander Macdougall:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or their own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic in
the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to
fill your own free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book can be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The
first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to attempt look for
book, may be the publication untitled Frankenstein (Illustrated) can be great book to read. May be it might be
best activity to you.

William Sebastian:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Frankenstein (Illustrated), you
are able to enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang-
out type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its known as reading
friends.

Jaclyn Warner:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is composed or printed or illustrated from each source that will filled update of news. In
this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
trying to find the Frankenstein (Illustrated) when you desired it?
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