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Despite all his disaster planning, and the bomb shelter he built under his shed, Mario Scietto was not
prepared for the apocalypse that hit Monument, Colorado. A series of escalating disasters, beginning with a
monster hailstorm and ending with a terrible chemical weapons spill that affects people differently
depending on blood type, has torn the world as he knows it apart. "What Mario Says" is set in the world of
Emmy Laybourne's Monument 14. The final book in the series, Monument 14: Savage Drift, goes on sale
May 6th.

This short story was acquired and edited for Tor.com by Feiwel & Friends editor Holly West.
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From reader reviews:

Johnny Allen:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot
of information that will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their particular reader with their
story or their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the books. But also they write about the data
about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons or
daughters, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their
expertise in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write on their book. One of them is this What
Mario Scietto Says: A Tor.Com Original (Monument 14 Series).

Erwin Fast:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try factor that really opposite from
that. One activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love What Mario Scietto Says: A Tor.Com
Original (Monument 14 Series), you can enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still desire to
miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout men. What? Still don't obtain it, oh
come on its called reading friends.

Paul Day:

What Mario Scietto Says: A Tor.Com Original (Monument 14 Series) can be one of your basic books that
are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that may
increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the
information. The article writer giving his/her effort to get every word into delight arrangement in writing
What Mario Scietto Says: A Tor.Com Original (Monument 14 Series) nevertheless doesn't forget the main
position, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource data that maybe you can be one of it.
This great information may drawn you into fresh stage of crucial considering.

Carmen Vasquez:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This What Mario Scietto Says: A Tor.Com
Original (Monument 14 Series) can be the respond to, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are so out
of date, spending your extra time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
textbooks have than the others?
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