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Forty years after the Battle of Yavin, a dangerous new era has begun as civil war threatens the unity of the
Galactic Alliance. In the wake of Corellia's failed bid for independence, Han and Leia Solo cannot stand by
and do nothing. They've decided to risk everything to help end the war as quickly as possible, though their
willingness to join Han's fellow Corellians has enraged their family and the Jedi, fighting on the side of the
Alliance. The Solos draw the line when they discover the rebels' plot to make the Hapan Consortium an
allywhich rests upon Hapan nobles murdering their pro-Alliance queen and her daughter. Yet Han and Leia's
selfless determination to save the queen cannot avert the inescapable consequences of their
actionsconsequences that will pit mother against son and brother against sister in the battles ahead. For as
Jacen Solo's dark powers grow stronger under the Dark Jedi Lumiya, and his influence over Ben Skywalker
becomes more insidious, Luke's concern for his nephew forces him into a life-and-death struggle against his
fiercest foe, and Han and Leia Solo find themselves at the mercy of their deadliest enemy...their son.
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From reader reviews:

Cinthia Beltran:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to
take a wander, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book titled Tempest;
Star Wars Legacy of the Force? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You realize beside you can
spend your time with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you
have additional opinion?

Lou Morton:

This Tempest; Star Wars Legacy of the Force is great reserve for you because the content and that is full of
information for you who have always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This
kind of book reveal it information accurately using great coordinate word or we can say no rambling
sentences inside it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only will
give you straight forward sentences but difficult core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having
Tempest; Star Wars Legacy of the Force in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, data in it is not
ridiculous one. We can say that no book that offer you world within ten or fifteen tiny right but this
publication already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt
that will?

Virginia Combs:

You may spend your free time to study this book this book. This Tempest; Star Wars Legacy of the Force is
simple to bring you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not have
much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You
can save the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys
this book.

Clifford Harvey:

Is it a person who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Tempest; Star Wars Legacy of the Force
can be the answer, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your free
time by reading in this completely new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than
the others?
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