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Project Puffin is the inspiring story of how a beloved seabird was restored to long-abandoned nesting
colonies off the Maine coast. As a young ornithology instructor at the Hog Island Audubon Camp, Dr.
Stephen W. Kress learned that puffins had nested on nearby islands until extirpated by hunters in the late
1800s. To right this environmental wrong, he resolved to bring puffins back to one such island—Eastern Egg
Rock. Yet bringing the plan to reality meant convincing skeptics, finding resources, and inventing restoration
methods at a time when many believed in “letting nature take its course.”

Today, Project Puffin has restored more than 1,000 puffin pairs to three Maine islands. But even more
exciting, techniques developed during the project have helped to restore rare and endangered seabirds
worldwide. Further, reestablished puffins now serve as a window into the effects of global warming. The
success of Dr. Kress’s project offers hope that people can restore lost wildlife populations and the habitats
that support them. The need for such inspiration has never been greater.
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From reader reviews:

Kevin Gans:

Book is definitely written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important point to bring us around
the world. Adjacent to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A publication Project Puffin: The
Improbable Quest to Bring a Beloved Seabird Back to Egg Rock will make you to become smarter. You can
feel much more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think that will open or reading
a new book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you looking
for best book or suitable book with you?

Deborah Tate:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what your own problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man or woman?
If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have
extra time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They should answer that question
simply because just their can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
suitable. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this kind of Project Puffin: The Improbable
Quest to Bring a Beloved Seabird Back to Egg Rock to read.

Anna Raynor:

The e-book untitled Project Puffin: The Improbable Quest to Bring a Beloved Seabird Back to Egg Rock is
the reserve that recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown
to anyone. The language that author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer
was did a lot of research when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to your account is
absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of Project Puffin: The Improbable Quest to Bring
a Beloved Seabird Back to Egg Rock from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Robert McCauley:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this reserve. This Project Puffin: The Improbable Quest to
Bring a Beloved Seabird Back to Egg Rock is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the beach, train
in addition to soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy
typically the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Thus
there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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