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This unique text is an introduction to harmonic analysis on the simplest symmetric spaces, namely Euclidean
space, the sphere, and the Poincaré upper half plane.  This book is intended for beginning graduate students
in mathematics or researchers in physics or engineering.  Written with an informal style, the book places an
emphasis on motivation, concrete examples, history, and, above all, applications in mathematics, statistics,
physics, and engineering.

Many corrections and updates have been incorporated in this new edition. Updates include discussions of P.
Sarnak and others' work on quantum chaos, the work of T. Sunada, Marie-France Vignéras, Carolyn Gordon,
and others on Mark Kac's question "Can you hear the shape of a drum?", A. Lubotzky, R. Phillips and P.
Sarnak's examples of Ramanujan graphs, and, finally, the author's comparisons of continuous theory with the
finite analogues.

Topics featured throughout the text include inversion formulas for Fourier transforms, central limit theorems,
Poisson's summation formula and applications in crystallography and number theory, applications of
spherical harmonic analysis to the hydrogen atom, the Radon transform, non-Euclidean geometry on the
Poincaré upper half plane H or unit disc and applications to microwave engineering, fundamental domains in
H for discrete groups Γ, tessellations of H from such discrete group actions, automorphic forms, and the
Selberg trace formula and its applications in spectral theory as well as number theory.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Berg:

The book Harmonic Analysis on Symmetric Spaces-Euclidean Space, the Sphere, and the Poincaré Upper
Half-Plane give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable
much more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem together
with your subject. If you can make looking at a book Harmonic Analysis on Symmetric Spaces-Euclidean
Space, the Sphere, and the Poincaré Upper Half-Plane being your habit, you can get considerably more
advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. It is possible
to know everything if you like wide open and read a book Harmonic Analysis on Symmetric Spaces-
Euclidean Space, the Sphere, and the Poincaré Upper Half-Plane. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that,
science book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Natalie Renz:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they're still students or the idea for all people in
the world, the particular best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that query above. Every
person has diverse personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great and important the book Harmonic Analysis on Symmetric
Spaces-Euclidean Space, the Sphere, and the Poincaré Upper Half-Plane. All type of book would you see on
many solutions. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Carolyn Cook:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
wide range of stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you
have when the spare time coming to you of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you ever try
this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, typically the
book you have read is Harmonic Analysis on Symmetric Spaces-Euclidean Space, the Sphere, and the
Poincaré Upper Half-Plane.

Brian Hill:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this publication. This Harmonic Analysis on Symmetric
Spaces-Euclidean Space, the Sphere, and the Poincaré Upper Half-Plane is simple to develop you can read it
in the playground, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not get much space to bring the actual
printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the actual book in
your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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