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When Algerian nationalists launched a rebellion against French rule in November 1954, France, mired in
similar wars for independence in its colonial territories, was in a poor position to cope with further upheaval.
The Algerian strategy encompassed varying approaches and was more adaptable than that of the French,
necessitating a rethinking of traditional counterinsurgency methods. In this volume, originally published in
1963, David Galula reconstructs the story of his highly successful command in the district of Greater
Kabylia, east of Algiers, at the height of the rebellion, and presents his theories on counterinsurgency and
pacification. In the process, he confronts the larger political, psychological, and military aspects of the
Algerian war, and provides a context for present-day counterinsurgency operations. This groundbreaking
work retains its relevancy as a challenge to traditional counterinsurgency tactics and presents approaches to
predicting, managing, and resolving insurgent and guerilla conflict. The parallels between the Algerian war
and modern warfare are striking, and lessons can be extracted from French successes and failures in its drive
to contain and manage the Algerian uprising. A new foreword by counterterrorism expert Bruce Hoffman
elucidates the relevance of this historic study in the context of modern times.
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From reader reviews:

Jerry Sonnier:

The book Pacification in Algeria, 1956-1958 can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the good thing like a book Pacification
in Algeria, 1956-1958? Several of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim that book can
give many info for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or facts that
you take for that, you could give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Pacification in
Algeria, 1956-1958 has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and massive function for you. You
can appearance the enormous world by wide open and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Robert Colgan:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or details even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era and that is always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe can update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to anyone is you don't know which you should start with. This Pacification in Algeria, 1956-1958 is
our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and
want in this era.

Lucy Carson:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information currently can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a understanding or any news even a problem. What people must be consider if those
information which is inside the former life are challenging be find than now could be taking seriously which
one is appropriate to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable resource then
you buy it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen throughout you if you take Pacification in Algeria, 1956-1958 as your daily resource information.

Edward Grimes:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Pacification in Algeria, 1956-1958
reserve written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book which can be understand by
anyone who all read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and producing
skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still uncertainty Pacification in Algeria, 1956-
1958 as good book not only by the cover but also with the content. This is one book that can break don't
judge book by its include, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on
your studying sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.
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