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This revised and expanded edition of Connections, now published by Hazelden, draws on empirically based
strategies to help your clients recognize shame as a universal experience and embrace authentic living as a
foundation for shame resilience. Topics include defining shame practicing empathy exploring triggers and
vulnerabilities practicing critical awareness reaching out to others creating, embracing, and inspiring change
Connections engages clients on a cognitive, behavioral, and interpersonal level. Clients learn via group and
personal exercises, handouts, and reading assignments from Brown's best-selling book I Thought It Was Just
Me (but it isn't): Telling the Truth About Perfectionism, Inadequacy, and Power. The Connections
curriculum includes a three-ring binder with facilitator information and lesson plans for twelve sessions, a
114-minute DVD, and a CD-ROM containing reproducible client handouts. The DVD features talks with the
author that are keyed to the sessions as well as an introduction to the curriculum. Summaries of the assigned
readings and DVD sessions are now included with the client reproducible handouts on the CD-ROM. Dr.
Brené Brown is a writer, researcher, educator, and activist. She is an award-winning member of the research
faculty at the University of Houston Graduate College of Social Work, where she has spent the past ten years
studying authenticity, belonging, and shame, and the effect these powerful emotions have on the way we
live, love, parent, work, and build relationships. Dr. Brown lives in Houston with her husband, Steve, and
their two children, Ellen and Charlie.
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From reader reviews:

Carol Rodgers:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book Connections Curriculum A 12 Session Psycho-
educational Shame Resilience Curriculum. You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. As long
as we know about how is important a book Connections Curriculum A 12 Session Psycho-educational
Shame Resilience Curriculum. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by a
book. Absolutely right, since from book you can learn everything! From your country until eventually
foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you could know that. In this
era, we can easily open a book as well as searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You may use it
when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's go through.

Lesley Dwyer:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material if you want something to
explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have spare time to
accomplish others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have spare time? What did you do?
Every person has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question simply because just their can
do in which. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because
start from on guardería until university need that Connections Curriculum A 12 Session Psycho-educational
Shame Resilience Curriculum to read.

Sylvia Alexander:

This Connections Curriculum A 12 Session Psycho-educational Shame Resilience Curriculum are reliable
for you who want to become a successful person, why. The key reason why of this Connections Curriculum
A 12 Session Psycho-educational Shame Resilience Curriculum can be on the list of great books you must
have is giving you more than just simple examining food but feed an individual with information that
possibly will shock your earlier knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and
whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed types. Beside that this Connections Curriculum A 12
Session Psycho-educational Shame Resilience Curriculum giving you an enormous of experience for
instance rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day action. So ,
let's have it and revel in reading.

Jean Gonzales:

You may spend your free time to learn this book this reserve. This Connections Curriculum A 12 Session
Psycho-educational Shame Resilience Curriculum is simple bringing you can read it in the area, in the beach,
train along with soon. If you did not have much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy often the
e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a
lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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