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“Every self-respecting household has a box – a box that holds treasures and memories, photos and
letters, newspaper clippings, hidden things, forgotten things, and sometimes poems.”

Disillusioned and frustrated at the turn that both her personal life and post-Mandela South Africa have taken,
Judy McLeod, former political activist and missionary, is rummaging through her box when she comes
across a blue and white marble. Transported back to the year she spent in Kangwane, South Africa just
before the first democratic election, Judy recalls the pleasures and pain, triumphs and tragedies and the
mystery she tried to unravel, before deciding to return there with her daughter.

In this sometimes hilarious, sometimes heart-breaking story of a village caught up in a time between times,
we meet the Renegade Sisters, the eccentric Khokho Mabuza, the “inappropriate” relationships that Judy gets
involved in, and the children, around whom the tragic events revolve.
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From reader reviews:

Coleen Faircloth:

Here thing why this kind of Khanyisa are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all looking at a book
is good but it really depends in the content than it which is the content is as tasty as food or not. Khanyisa
giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no
publication that similar with Khanyisa. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your own eyes about
the thing which happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. It is possible to bring
everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your technique home by train. When you are having
difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of Khanyisa in e-book can be your option.

Linda Gordon:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading practice give you
lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book this
improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of publication you read, if
you want drive more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly feel happy read one
together with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual Khanyisa is kind of book which
is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Donna Muniz:

Typically the book Khanyisa has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot
of help. The book was written by the very famous author. The writer makes some research prior to write this
book. That book very easy to read you will get the point easily after perusing this book.

Ora Orozco:

Beside this kind of Khanyisa in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get more close to the new
knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh from your oven so don't
possibly be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Khanyisa
because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you
would not get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this
with your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. So do
you still want to miss the idea? Find this book along with read it from currently!
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