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Supposedly some of our brightest speakers, politicians say some pretty stupid things. Members of America's
major political parties put out a roaring stream of downright dumb comments, pronouncements, and
observations. For proof, look no further than Ted Rueter's two new books, 449 Stupid Things Republicans
Have Said and 449 Stupid Things Democrats Have Said.The Dems fair little better in 449 Stupid Things
Democrats Have Said. Al Gore said, "I would have kissed Tipper longer at the convention." Hillary Rodham
Clinton, during a 2000 campaign interview with Hot 97, a Manhattan hip-hop radio station, stated, "Motown,
Motown: That's my era. Those are my people." Rueter snags them all and provides two wonderful collections
of quotations that will truly go down in history.
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From reader reviews:

Carl Yeates:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
Yep, by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand than other is high. For
you personally who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this particular 449 Stupid Things
Democrats Have Said book as beginning and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more than just
a book.

Charles Siegrist:

The particular book 449 Stupid Things Democrats Have Said will bring you to the new experience of reading
some sort of book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to study,
this book very ideal to you. The book 449 Stupid Things Democrats Have Said is much recommended to you
to learn. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Micah Clark:

The guide with title 449 Stupid Things Democrats Have Said contains a lot of information that you can find
out it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This specific book exist new knowledge the information
that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to find out how
the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the glowbal growth. You
can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Elaine Sitz:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day through watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This 449 Stupid Things Democrats Have Said can
be the solution, oh how comes? A book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your spare time
by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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