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In the year 2020, mankind made its first steps on another planet, Mars. Shortly after, through sudden
scientific breakthroughs, a colony was established. Mankind for the first time in its history finally had a
second planet to call home. Six decades later, during the celebration of the 250,000th inhabitant of Mars, life
was about to take an unexpected turn for two Martian brothers. Michael and Jacob Stele may appear to be
average Martians but, unbeknown to them, they were about to become part of one of the defining moments
in human history. Shortly after an alien artefact is discovered on Mars, the EMA (Earth Mars Alliance)
reveals a shocking secret to them, along with an amazing opportunity of a lifetime. Michael and Jacob
eventually find themselves trapped in a situation no one could have imagined, where the very survival of the
human race is at stake. Along the way they discover new friends and new enemies, as well as discovering
what it means to be human and the true limits of human endurance and determination.
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From reader reviews:

Jose Scott:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Solus, you could enjoy both. It is good
combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout guys.
What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Jennifer Garza:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on
book like comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not seeking Solus that give your
entertainment preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading practice all over the world
can be said as the opportinity for people to know world better then how they react toward the world. It can't
be stated constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to always be
success person. So , for every you who want to start studying as your good habit, it is possible to pick Solus
become your own starter.

Timothy Hardy:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Solus e-book written by well-known
writer who really knows well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who also read the book.
Written in good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your own
hunger then you still question Solus as good book not simply by the cover but also through the content. This
is one reserve that can break don't ascertain book by its include, so do you still needing a different sixth
sense to pick that!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening
to a different sixth sense.

Thomas Hill:

Is it you actually who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Solus can be the reply, oh how
comes? A book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this fresh
era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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