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In The Day the Universe Changed, James Burke examines eight periods in history when our view of the
world shifted dramatically: in the eleventh century, when extraordinary discoveries were made by Spanish
crusaders; in fourteenth-century Florence, where perspective in painting emerged; in the fifteenth century,
when the advent of the printing press shook the foundations of an oral society; in the sixteenth century, when
gunnery developments triggered the birth of modern science; in the early eighteenth century, when hot
English summers brought on the Industrial Revolution; in the battlefield surgery stations of the French
revolutionary armies, where people first became statistics; in the nineteenth century, when the discovery of
dinosaur fossils led to the theory of evolution; and in the 1820s, when electrical experiments heralded the
end of scientific certainty. Based on the popular television documentary series, The Day the Universe
Changed is a bestselling history that challenges the reader to decide whether there is absolute knowledge to
discover - or whether the universe is "ultimately what we say it is".
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From reader reviews:

Jimmy Dietz:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or that for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has diverse personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't wish do that. You must know how great and important the book Day the Universe Changed. All
type of book is it possible to see on many resources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social
media.

Jeff Williams:

Day the Universe Changed can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. Many of us recommend
that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in words, easy
to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to
get every word into delight arrangement in writing Day the Universe Changed yet doesn't forget the main
point, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource information that maybe you can be one
of it. This great information can drawn you into fresh stage of crucial contemplating.

Ronald Hill:

The book untitled Day the Universe Changed contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains the
woman idea with easy method. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do not worry,
you can easy to read the item. The book was compiled by famous author. The author gives you in the new
age of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or model, so
you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can
open their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice read.

Roger Cooper:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got scholars? We believe that that query was
given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And also you know
that little person such as reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that reading is very
important as well as book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except your
own teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about something by book. A substantial number
of sorts of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them are these claims Day the Universe
Changed.
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