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-- Presents all areas of mathematical calculations needed by nurses in clinical practice, including acute care
and home health-- Interactive, self-paced approach to dosage calculation permits both directed and
independent study-- Choice of three major methods of dosage calculation: linear ratio and proportion,
formula, or dimensional analysis-- Critical thinking skills are applied in practice problems that use actual
clinical situations-- Comprehensive review of basic mathematical skills includes review tests-- Includes drug
labels, syringe and medicine cup animations, and IV equipment photos to reinforce student learning--
Workbook allows students to practice their mathematical skills when they are away from a computer
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From reader reviews:

Homer Douglas:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they are still students or it for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that query above. Every person has different
personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't need do
that. You must know how great and also important the book Calculating Drug Dosages: An Interactive
Approach to Learning Nursing Math (Workbook with CD-ROM). All type of book can you see on many
resources. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Matthew German:

Typically the book Calculating Drug Dosages: An Interactive Approach to Learning Nursing Math
(Workbook with CD-ROM) has a lot details on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot
of benefit. The book was written by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research previous to
write this book. This book very easy to read you can get the point easily after looking over this book.

Perla Baxter:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you might have it in e-
book method, more simple and reachable. That Calculating Drug Dosages: An Interactive Approach to
Learning Nursing Math (Workbook with CD-ROM) can give you a lot of close friends because by you
considering this one book you have thing that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person.
This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This book offer you information that
perhaps your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than different make you to be great persons. So , why
hesitate? We need to have Calculating Drug Dosages: An Interactive Approach to Learning Nursing Math
(Workbook with CD-ROM).

Jamie Ault:

A lot of book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by internet on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is known
as of book Calculating Drug Dosages: An Interactive Approach to Learning Nursing Math (Workbook with
CD-ROM). You can include your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it might add
your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about guide. It can
bring you from one destination to other place.
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