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The first major historical account of gender politics during the Nasser era, Revolutionary Womanhood
analyzes feminism as a system of ideas and political practices, international in origin but local in iteration.
Drawing connections between the secular nationalist projects that emerged in the 1950s and the gender
politics of Islamism today, Laura Bier reveals how discussions about education, companionate marriage, and
enlightened motherhood, as well as veiling, work, and other means of claiming public space created
opportunities to reconsider the relationship between modernity, state feminism, and postcolonial state-
building.

Bier highlights attempts by political elites under Nasser to transform Egyptian women into national subjects.
These attempts to fashion a "new" yet authentically Egyptian woman both enabled and constrained women's
notions of gender, liberation, and agency. Ultimately, Bier challenges the common assumption that these
emerging feminisms were somehow not culturally or religiously authentic, and details their lasting impact on
Egyptian womanhood today.
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From reader reviews:

Ashley Mansfield:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with
their family, or their own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, likely to beach,
or picnic within the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to
something different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book can be option to fill your
free time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want
to test look for book, may be the publication untitled Revolutionary Womanhood: Feminisms, Modernity,
and the State in Nasser's Egypt (Stanford Studies in Middle Eastern and I) can be excellent book to read.
May be it can be best activity to you.

Marie Aultman:

Often the book Revolutionary Womanhood: Feminisms, Modernity, and the State in Nasser's Egypt
(Stanford Studies in Middle Eastern and I) has a lot info on it. So when you make sure to read this book you
can get a lot of profit. The book was published by the very famous author. The author makes some research
ahead of write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can find the point easily after perusing this
book.

Lourdes Tyner:

This Revolutionary Womanhood: Feminisms, Modernity, and the State in Nasser's Egypt (Stanford Studies
in Middle Eastern and I) is great publication for you because the content which can be full of information for
you who also always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal
it details accurately using great coordinate word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside it. So if you
are read that hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight
forward sentences but challenging core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having
Revolutionary Womanhood: Feminisms, Modernity, and the State in Nasser's Egypt (Stanford Studies in
Middle Eastern and I) in your hand like getting the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous one. We
can say that no reserve that offer you world within ten or fifteen second right but this publication already do
that. So , this can be good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt which?

Joshua White:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update
of news. In this particular modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a
person. From media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book,
fresh and comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your
book? Or just seeking the Revolutionary Womanhood: Feminisms, Modernity, and the State in Nasser's



Egypt (Stanford Studies in Middle Eastern and I) when you essential it?
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