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Bank Organized to do Business in Foreign Countries Usm of American Credit Facilities as A gainst Foreign
forced the other banks to modify their resistance and to compete for our bills which, up to that time, they hati
tried to disregard. It is to be hoped that other American banks will soon follow in establishing themselves in
foreign countries. As you know, the Federal Reserve Board has recommended an amendment to the A ct to
enable national banks, singly or jointly, to hold stock in banks organized principally to do business in foreign
countries. One bill has already passed the House,.and another has been reported favorably by the Senate
committee on banking and currency. The Board hopes that a satisfactory bill will be agreed upon by both
houses in the very near future. It is a strange fact, however, that many of our business men, who enjoy the
reputation of being keen and progressive, are actually wasting their funds by still using foreign acceptance
credits instead of A merican. At Rio I found to my surprise that the majority of American coffee importers
were still using letters of credit in sterling for which they were paying a discount rate of about 4%% as
against the American discount rate of 2%. Moreover, in doing so, they were often paying two commissions,
one to the foreign banker who issues, and one to the American banker who opens the credit, instead of
paying a single commission to the American banker. It is true that the wool and hide business, done by New
England with the A rgentine, is today financed by dollar acceptances drawn on Boston and New York, and
that the oriental trade has begun to use dollar bills, but it is surprising that so large a number of New York
importers ai estill clinging to their old pound sterling acceptance arrangements.
(Typographical errors above are due to OCR software and don't occur in the book.)
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From reader reviews:

Jacquelyn Lopez:

With other case, little individuals like to read book The Federal Reserve System and the Banks (Classic
Reprint). You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. As long as we know about how is
important a book The Federal Reserve System and the Banks (Classic Reprint). You can add information and
of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can recognize
everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple thing until
wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, you can open a book or searching by internet device. It is
called e-book. You may use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's examine.

Michael Rodiguez:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy particular
person? If you don't have spare time to do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster.
And you have free time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They must answer that
question mainly because just their can do which. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every
person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this kind of The
Federal Reserve System and the Banks (Classic Reprint) to read.

Joel Jones:

This The Federal Reserve System and the Banks (Classic Reprint) is new way for you who has curiosity to
look for some information mainly because it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you on it getting
knowledge more you know or else you who still having little bit of digest in reading this The Federal
Reserve System and the Banks (Classic Reprint) can be the light food for you because the information inside
this specific book is easy to get by anyone. These books develop itself in the form which can be reachable by
anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in publication form make them
feel sleepy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a e-book especially this one. You
can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book variety
for your better life and also knowledge.

Christie Rich:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our know-how for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we wish. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This reserve The Federal Reserve System and the Banks (Classic Reprint) was filled in
relation to science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some
people has different feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can
experience enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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