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From late 2010 a series of dramatic and unprecedented events swept across the Middle East and North
Africa, toppling several autocratic regimes that had held power for decades and ushering in a new climate of
dissent and democratisation. The Arab Revolutions in Context seizes a unique opportunity to reflect on these
seismic events, their causes and consequences, and the core issues facing the region as it moves forward.
This volume is more than a collection of detailed thematic essays, however. It situates the Arab Revolutions
within their broader contextual backgrounds--showing that a unique set of historical events, as well as local,
regional and global dynamics, has converged to provide the catalyst that triggered the recent revolts--and
also within a new conceptual framework. The argument here is that the Arab Revolutions pose a very
specific challenge to conventional wisdom concerning democracy and democratisation in the Middle East.
The Arab Revolutions in Context is the first volume of its kind to address the Arab Revolutions and the
varying analyses, debates and discussions that they have stimulated.
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From reader reviews:

Gary Simms:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be change about what going on or data even knowledge
to make these individuals keep up with the era and that is always change and progress. Some of you maybe
will probably update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to a person is you don't know which you should start with. This The Arab Revolution in Context:
Civil Society and Democracy in a Changing Middle East (Islamic Studies Series) is our recommendation to
make you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Lily McDermott:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you
can read a book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent the
whole day to reading a reserve. The book The Arab Revolution in Context: Civil Society and Democracy in a
Changing Middle East (Islamic Studies Series) it is rather good to read. There are a lot of people that
recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space
to bring this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from your smart
phone. The price is not to cover but this book provides high quality.

Donald Fujita:

A lot of publication has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You
can choose the very best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is
referred to as of book The Arab Revolution in Context: Civil Society and Democracy in a Changing Middle
East (Islamic Studies Series). You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book,
it could add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware
about reserve. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.

Albert Hartley:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that query
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person such as reading or as reading through become their hobby. You should know that
reading is very important and book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except
your own personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update regarding something by book.
Numerous books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is this The Arab Revolution in
Context: Civil Society and Democracy in a Changing Middle East (Islamic Studies Series).
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